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PSY 103 Developmental Psychology 

What would you like to say about this course to a student who is considering 
taking it in the future? 
 
It's a good class! Discussions are fun and help you understand the readings but are 
pretty separate from lecture, so don't rely on them to teach you content. 
 
Jaime is a cool person. Very happy to have been a part of his discussion section! 
 
Jaime is an incredibly understanding TA. I loved having him as my discussion facilitator 
and would highly encourage anyone interested in taking Dev Psych to enroll in his 
discussion section. He was very succinctly able to encourage conversations about the 
topics at hand and he was very knowledgeable about the subjects we discussed. 
 
Jaime was a great TA, always very welcoming and open to student's needs. 
 
Jaime was a wonderful, supportive, and fun TA. The discussion was engaging and 
valuable. 
 
Section is the most engaging part of this course. Discussions are always interesting and 
it explores topics outside of the textbook and lecture. 
 
Take this class!! Professor Wilbourn is wonderful and my TA Jaime was so helpful and 
understanding!! Loved this class and found it so interesting and the teachers were so 
understanding about the difficulties of online class. Had such a great experience! 
 
The discussion sections were very engaging and I felt welcomed and the conversations 
were very engaging and in depth, analytical. 
 
The discussions in this class are very inviting and friendly. Everyone is capable of 
sharing and enjoying themselves. 
 
This was an excellent course. Discussion was a great time to talk about what we 
learned and you are able to gain a lot of new insight, learn of other people's opinions 
 
very open talking environment, and interesting topics to talk about. 
 
Would you like to provide any other comments about this course? 
 
A diversity of opinions on the ethical questions were not voiced by students in the 
discussion section. Many students started their comment with "I agree with everything 
everyone's said before," which is telling of how students weren't encouraged or willing to 
take up different perspectives. 
 
Discussion was very well structured, organized and easy to participate in 
 
Great job! 



PSY 103 Developmental Psychology 

I think that the lectures could have had a more predictable schedule, but I understand 
that life right now is very unpredictable in 2020 so it was ok to work around. I think that 
you could give students more guidance surrounding what specific  topics will be covered 
on each exam, since I spent most of my time outside of class reading the very long 
textbook chapters. It would be much more efficient if you knew ahead of time what 
topics to look out for that would be covered. 
 
N/A 
 
N/a 
 
no 
 
No 
 
No! I overall really enjoyed this course and learned a lot. 
 
Stay up to date on work and contribute in discussion. 
 
The discussion sections were highly engaging and there was always very lively 
discussion! 
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